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1. INTRODUCTION 

The concepts of macroeconomic competitiveness and foreign direct 
investment (FDI) have always stood at the forefront of international business 
research. Their relationship has played a particularly crucial role in the 
context of the transition of the former centrally-planned economies of the 
region of Central and Eastern Europe (CEE) towards a market-led system. 
This process of economic transformation was accompanied by the increasing 
integration of local economies into the global business environment. 
Accordingly, one of the significant features of the transformation in the CEE 
region initiated around 1989 was the systematic opening of the regional 
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economies to FDI (Gorynia et al. 2016). This process was facilitated by 
economic reforms, including inter alia the liberalization of legal regulations 
concerning the inflow of foreign direct investments, the liberalization of 
foreign trade and principles of currency convertibility, as well as the 
privatization of state-owned enterprises (Kubielas et al., 1996). 

The interplay between inward and outward FDI in conjunction with the 
economic development of a given country constitutes the essence of the 
investment development path (IDP) model (paradigm) (Dunning, 1981, 
1986; Dunning and Narula, 1994, 1996). In the context of this model, a 
comparative analysis is conducted of the IDPs of eleven Central and Eastern 
European (CEE) countries, all members of the European Union: Bulgaria, 
Croatia, Czechia, Estonia, Hungary, Latvia, Lithuania, Poland, Romania, 
Slovakia and Slovenia. This group of countries shows relative homogeneity 
in terms of sharing the same communist heritage, common experience in 
establishing and developing a market economy, and in acceding to the 
European Union (EU): with eight countries joining the EU in 2004, two 
(Bulgaria and Romania) in 2007 and the last one (Croatia), in 2013. 
Moreover, all of these countries display relative homogeneity in terms of 
many socio-economic variables (Niroomand and Nissan, 2007) and have 
exhibited a tendency to economic convergence over the last two decades 
(Amplatz, 2003, and Matkowski and Próchniak, 2007). At the same time, 
however, there are considerable differences between them in their level of 
development and in the completion of the transition process to a market-led 
system (see e.g. Caporaleet al., 2009). 

The main purpose of this study is to determine the timing and explore the 
factors that have influenced the movement of the eleven CEE countries 
through their IDP stages. Thereafter, conclusions and policy recommendations 
are presented, which are not only applicable to the analyzed countries, but 
which might serve as guidelines or simply be of interest to other CEE states, 
particularly those that are prospective members of the EU. 

The paper sets out by presenting the IDP model (paradigm) and briefly 
describing its five stages. The same section reviews the relevant literature, 
focusing on those studies that applied the IDP model to the CEE economies. 
In the next section, the authors try to determine the current positioning of the 
eleven countries on the IDP, using both a graph depicting the relationship 
between net outward investment (NOI) position per capita and GDP per 
capita, as well as detailed data on inward and outward FDI stocks and NOI’s 
absolute values presented in the tables. Thereafter, the authors focus on the 
CEE-11 countries’ outward FDI and apply the outward FDI performance 
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index in their analysis of that outward investment. The index is used to 
supplement and enrich the analysis of the countries’ IDP positioning 
conducted in the previous sections. In the concluding section, the authors 
summarize their findings and reveal the need to add new theoretical 
considerations to the IDP original model. The concluding section also 
outlines future research avenues regarding CEE countries’ IDPs. 

2. LITERATURE REVIEW ON RECENT STUDIES  
OF THE IDP IN CEE COUNTRIES 

The concept (model) of the investment development path (IDP) was 
introduced by Dunning (1981), and further refined by Dunning (1986) and 
his co-authors (Dunning and Narula, 1994, 1996, 2002; and Narula and 
Dunning, 2010). The model provides a framework to analyze the dynamic 
relationship between FDI and economic development. The two variables 
used in determining a country’s position on the IDP are the net outward 
investment (NOI) and GDP per capita. The NOI is calculated as a difference 
between outward FDI and inward FDI stock. Thus, the dynamic relationship 
between outward and inward FDI is at the heart of the IDP model. The 
changes in GDP are treated as proxy of economic development. As countries 
develop, they pass through five consecutive stages of the IDP. Each stage 
can be succinctly summarized as follows: 

Stage 1 – Countries receive little inward FDI initially and make almost no 
outward FDI. The NOIP is negative and decreasing, first slowly and then 
more rapidly. 

Stage 2 – Countries receive growing amounts of inward FDI but still 
invest relatively little abroad, thus becoming a large net FDI importer. At the 
end of this stage however, outward FDI grows faster than inward FDI and 
the negative NOI stops increasing. 

Stage 3 – Countries still record more inward than outward FDI stock but 
the latter is growing faster than the former. As a result, at the end of this 
stage, the NOI assumes values close to zero. 

Stage 4 – Countries record more outward than inward FDI stock, thus 
being a net FDI exporter. The NOI assumes consistently positive and 
growing values. 

Stage 5 – After having seen inward FDI growing faster than outward FDI, 
countries experience balanced, albeit fluctuating from year to year, high 
levels of inward and outward FDI. The NOI first falls and then fluctuates, 
assuming temporarily positive and negative values. 
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The theoretical explanation of the underlying causes of the above-
outlined stages is rather complex, but generally one can state that the IDP 
changes occur in response to the interplay between investment attractiveness 
of a country (L-advantages) and the international competitiveness of its 
firms (O-advantages). Moreover, movement along the IDP generally 
parallels countries’ growing wealth, measured by GDP. Accordingly, 
developed countries are typically in Stages 4 and 5, the least-developed 
countries are in Stage 1, and the developing and transition economies are in 
Stages 2 or 3. However, Narula and Dunning (2010) caution against a 
simplistic, or narrow, application of these two variables – NOI and GDP – in 
order to identify and explain countries’ IDP; they argue that studies using the 
IDP framework should adopt a broader perspective on a country’s FDI 
changes, taking into account the idiosyncratic economic structure of each 
country, as well as the complex forces and interactions that determine the 
turning points of the IDP in each case. This is echoed by Narula and Guimón 
(2010) who recommend that an empirical analysis of the relationship 
between a country’s NOI position and its GDP per capita “need to be 
complemented with a deeper qualitative assessment of the interaction 
between FDI and development” (p. 8). 

The IDP model has been used as a conceptual framework in guiding 
numerous empirical studies which, by and large, attempted to validate it by 
employing either cross-sectional or longitudinal data sets (Gorynia, Nowak 
and Wolniak, 2006). However, a relatively small number of studies could be 
identified that directly or indirectly deal with the IDPs of CEE countries. 

Gorynia et al. (2010a, 2010b and 2012) provide a comprehensive review 
of IDP studies concerning Central and Eastern Europe, covering the period 
1990 through to the early 2000s. Four of the studies represent a cross-nation 
comparative analysis of IDPs (Boudier-Bensebaa, 2008; Kalotay, 2004; 
Kottardi et al., 2004; and Svetličič and Jaklič, 2003), while several others 
were focused on individual countries’ IDP, most of them published in a 
volume edited by Svetličič and Rojec (2003). A general conclusion from 
Gorynia et al.’s literature review regarding the positioning of CEE countries 
on the IDP was that virtually all the countries, for which studies had been 
conducted, transitioned from Stage 1 to Stage 2 of the IDP in the latter part 
of the nineties, and were moving along Stage 2 in the early 2000s. A notable 
exception was the Russian Federation, which revealed a paradoxical pattern 
of IDP development (Kalotay, 2005, 2008). In spite of being a lower middle-
income country, Russia was, during the early2000s, already a net FDI 
exporter, thus technically passing through Stage 4 of the IDP. Russia’s 
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idiosyncratic IDP could be explained by the country’s significant barriers to 
attracting FDI (notably high institutional and political risk) on the one hand, 
and the propensity to invest abroad by energy and raw material sector 
companies, fuelled by their surplus liquidity, on the other hand. 

The empirical investigation of IDP conducted by Gorynia et al. (2010a, 
2010b, 2012), first for four and then for ten countries of Central and Eastern 
Europe (new members of the EU), covering the period 1990-2008, 
complemented the earlier studies referred to above by extending the time 
frame of analysis well into the 2000s. A general conclusion from that 
investigation was that in their economic development viewed from a 
perspective of 19 years since the start of the transition process, the ten CEE 
countries followed the basic premise and trajectories as set forth in the 
original IDP model. There were, however, certain exceptions which could be 
explained by the idiosyncratic nature of the transition process per se and the 
varying effects of the 2008 recession. The regression analysis indicated that 
five of the studied countries (Czechia, Estonia, Hungary, Lithuania and 
Poland) were in Stage 3 of their IDPs, whereas the other five (Bulgaria, 
Latvia, Romania, Slovenia and Slovakia) were still in Stage 2, although 
Slovenia showed a tendency to fluctuate around the border of Stage 3 and 
Romania was about to enter Stage 3 (Gorynia et al., 2012). 

A number of studies applying the IDP model to CEE countries have 
appeared since 2010 (they were not reviewed in the authors’ previous 
publications). They can also be divided into single and multi-country 
analyses. The single-country studies concern Poland, Romania and Slovakia. 
Ciesielska (2014) undertakes a study of Polish OFDI during the period 2000-
2012. This author’s conclusion regarding the positioning of Poland on the 
IDP is that the country has already entered Stage 3. This position is seen by 
Ciesielska as a result of a stronger growth in outward FDI than inward FDI 
from 2007 to 2012. Ciesielska’s finding corroborates an earlier conclusion 
reached by Gorynia et al. (2012) regarding Poland. Maşca and Văidean 
(2010), who studied Romania’s IDP during 1990-2007, come to the 
conclusion that their country is in transition to Stage 3. This is also, by and 
large, consistent with Gorynia et al.’s (2012) study. On the other hand, 
Birsan et al.'s (2011) study of Romania’s IDP for the period 1990-2009 
clearly points to idiosyncrasies of the IDP trajectory in Romania which, 
according to these authors, was firmly positioned in Stage 2 at the end of the 
studied period. One of the idiosyncrasies observed by Birsan et al. was that 
Romania, unlike other EU CEE countries, entered Stage 2 only in 2004. 
Also, Ferencikova and Ferencikova’s (2012) assessment of Slovakia’s 
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position on the IDP differs from Gorynia et al.'s. These authors place 
Slovakia in Stage 3 at the end of 2008, although they admit that it most 
likely falls in the earlier parts of this stage. However, there is little empirical 
evidence in Ferencikova and Ferencikova’s article to support that view as 
these authors do not conduct any quantitative analysis of Slovakia’s NOI. 

Three recent studies conduct a comparative analysis of IDPs of CEE and 
other countries. Zdziarski (2016) concentrates his analysis on the NOI 
position of the Visegrad Group vs. BRIC countries and finds this position 
changing from negative to positive, in favor of Visegrad, over the period of 
2001-2012, overall. At the same time, this author, based on the observation 
of the rapid decline of the negative value of NOI for the four countries vis-à-
vis the world, concludes that the Visegrad Group is still in Stage 2 of the 
IDP model. 

Stoian’s (2013) work, on the other hand, represents a different approach 
to IDP studies. This author tests a number of hypotheses derived from an 
augmented IDP model. The augmentation of the model consists of 
incorporating into it the effects of home country institutional factors on the 
level of OFDI (derived from institutional theory). The premise of this study 
is that GDP per capita is too rough an indicator of economic development 
and thus supplementary factors should be included in the IDP model (Stoian, 
2013, p. 621). This is particularly important with respect to the post-
communist countries which have undergone dramatic institutional reforms 
during their transition to a market economy. Stoian tested the proposed 
conceptual framework by using a panel data set for 15 years (1996-2010) 
and for 20 CEE countries. Support was found for the IDP theory, as OFDI 
was positively associated with both GDP per capita and inward FDI. It was 
also found that overall institutional reforms and reforms related to 
competition policy enhanced OFDI, while large scale privatization, 
enterprise restructuring or trade liberalization alone do not. Surprisingly, 
technological development of the country (measured as a percentage of 
R&D expenditures in GDP) had a negative effect on OFDI. This finding 
seems to indicate that CEE companies, when investing abroad, do not rely 
on R&D as a competitive advantage. As a cursory analysis (apparently based 
only on an examination of raw data), Stoian assessed the position of the 20 
countries on the IDP and concluded that all CEE countries, except Russia, 
were in the second stage of the IDP (Russia was in the third stage). This is 
consistent with the earlier studies (notably Boudier-Bensebaa, 2008; and 
Kalotay, 2004) but contradicts some of the findings of the newer studies (e.g. 
Gorynia et al., 2012). 
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Narula and Guimón (2010), while focusing on the proposed revisions to 
the IDP model and advocating a broader perspective, encompassing the 
idiosyncratic economic structure of countries as well as the heterogeneous 
nature of FDI, draw certain implications for CEECs. The authors argue that: 
“any attempt to analyze the IDP of Central and Eastern European countries 
(CEECs) needs to carefully consider their very specific historical and 
political context. The shape and characteristics of the IDP in the CEECs are 
heavily influenced by the transition from socialism to capitalism taking place 
during the 1990s and the subsequent accession into the EU of many of these 
countries in the mid 2000s” (p. 13). In this context, Narula and Guimón 
compare the NOIs of four CEECs (Bulgaria, Czechia, Hungary and 
Romania) with those of six “older” members of the EU and conclude that the 
changes in NOI positions of CEE countries in the first decade of 2000s were 
characteristic of Stage 2 of the IDP. 

In conclusion, one can draw two important implications from the above 
literature review for the present paper. First, the research findings are 
somewhat inconsistent regarding the positioning of CEE countries on the 
IDP. While there is almost a consensus that these countries moved from 
Stage 1 to Stage 2 in the 1990s (the only possible exception is Romania), 
conclusions differ regarding the possible transition to Stage 3 of the IDP in 
the first decade of the 2000s. Therefore there is a need to revisit this 
assessment, using newer data sets covering the years after 2008. 

3. ANALYSIS OF CURRENT POSITIONING ON COUNTRY IDPS 

The ensuing analysis of country positioning during the investigated 
period, i.e. the period 2009-2014, on the respective country IDPs, is based on 
the country IDP curves visualized in Figure 1, which does not show however 
the time axis, and Table 1, which does include this axis as well as 
corresponding GDP p.c. and NOI p.c. data. 

The first in the studied group to attain the lowest negative NOI p.c. (i.e. the 
highest negative value) after which it started to increase (i.e. became less 
negative) indicating, according to the IDP paradigm, movement from IDP 
Stage 2 to Stage 3, was Hungary. Already in 2009 it reached the lowest value 
of -7,698 USD at a GDP p.c. value of 12,896 USD. However, after two 
subsequent years of NOI p.c. increase, its value fell again for two more years 
to rise in the last recorded year of 2014 at the GDP p.c. level of 13,803 USD. 
These increases were due to a fall in those respective years of inward FDI 
stock (as seen in Table 2). This  case  points to the fact that the movement on 
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a country’s IDP trajectory might be reversible, at least in the short run. Such 
fluctuations as seen in Hungary are also visible in the IDP trajectory of 
Croatia, which had the lowest NOI p.c. of -9,147 USD in 2007 but in the 
currently studied time period reached a new minimum of -6,477 USD in 
2010 and after a rise a still new minimum of -6,016 USD in 2013, at a GDP 
p.c. of 13,490 USD, attained due to the decrease for the last two years in 
outward FDI stock and  increase  in  inward  FDI  stock  (see Table 2). These 
 

 

Fig. 1. NOI per capita and GDP per capita in USD, 1990 – 2014, CEE–11 countries 

Source: authors’ calculations based on UNCTAD Stat. 
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fluctuations had however the desirable upward trend of moving the country 
positioning ever closer to the juncture with the IDP Stage 3. In the Czechia’s 
case the absolute (in terms of records for the whole investigated period) 
lowest (negative) NOI p.c. reading of -11,297 USD was observed in 2012. 
Thus Czechia, with a GDP p.c. of 19,395 USD, the highest of the three 
countries being at the interface of Stage 2 and Stage 3 of their respective 
IDPs, was also the last to reach such positioning. 

The remaining seven countries in the investigated group (Bulgaria, 
Poland, Romania, Slovakia, Estonia, Latvia and Lithuania) recorded their 
lowest (in the entire analyzed period) NOI p.c. in 2013, which indicates that 
in that year they were on the verge of passing from Stage 2 to Stage 3 of 
their IDPs. Romania had the highest but still negative NOI p.c. of -4,134 
USD, due however to a relatively low level of outward FDI stock compared 
with the rest of the group, and the lowest GDP p.c. of 8,853 USD. Thereafter 
came Lithuania, also with a relatively high negative NOI p.c. of -4,803 USD 
but a much higher GDP p.c. of 15,064 USD. Third in this ranking was 
Poland with a NOI p.c. of -5,200 USD, due to relatively high levels of both 
outward and inward FDI stocks as visible in Table 2 (the inward FDI being 
continuously attracted by the country’s large internal market). This was 
recorded at the GDP p.c. level of 13,760 USD. Next in line was Bulgaria 
with a NOI p.c. of -6744 USD recorded at a GDP p.c. of 7,543 USD. Then 
came Latvia with a NOI p.c. of -7,136 USD, due to relatively low levels of 
both outward and inward FDI stocks compared with the rest of the group, 
and a moderate GDP p.c. of 15,064 USD. Slovakia followed with a higher 
negative NOI p.c. of -9,916 USD and a higher GDP p.c. of 17,928 USD. 
Estonia closed the year 2013 with the lowest NOI p.c. classification with a 
larger negative NOI p.c. of -10,806 USD and also a larger GDP p.c. of 
19,328 USD. The trend in this sub group was clear: countries with larger 
GDP p.c. also exhibited decreasing values of NOI p.c. at which point the 
passing from Stage 2 to Stage 3 of their IDPs occurred. One possible 
explanation for this could be that higher GDP p.c. reflected higher internal 
demand which attracted more inward FDI at a still nascent stage of outward 
FDI, which remained much lower than the inward one. 

The last in the studied group was Slovenia which reached the turning 
point (absolute lowest NOI p.c.) in 2014 (the last year for the whole group), 
with a value of -3,170 USD (the highest recorded level for the whole group) 
and the highest GDP p.c. of 23,800 USD. Slovenia’s lowest NOI p.c. was 
due to a continuous rise since 2010 in inward FDI stock coupled also with a 
continuing decrease in outward FDI stock (Table 2). The overall trend 
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observed was that with rising GDP p.c. of a country, the said turning point 
was positioned later on the time axis. This produced the somewhat 
paradoxical effect that “poorer” countries were reaching the IDP Stage 2 and 
Stage 3 interface earlier that the “rich” ones. 

4. THE EFFECTS OF OUTWARD FDI PERFORMANCE INDEX  
ON COUNTRY IDP PERFORMANCE 

The outward FDI performance index (OFDIPI) determines the magnitude 
of outward FDI which a country generates relative to its economic potential, 
indirectly indicating whether the country has the capacity to advance on its 
IDP. The values of the said index of less than 1 signify that outward FDI is 
less than proportional to the potential of the home country’s economy as 
measured by its participation in the global economy. If, on the other hand, 
the values of the said index are higher than 1, then the outward FDI is more 
than proportional relative to the aforementioned potential of the home 
economy. From the point of view of IDP positioning, the closer the index is 
to 1 or higher than 1, the more predisposed a given country is to move along 
on its IDP trajectory or, in the case of the present research, to reach Stage 3 
of its IDP or continue moving within Stage 3. 

In this context, the values of the said index as applied to the eleven 
countries in this study are also presented in Table 1. It should be stressed that 
the data for the beginning of the 1990s were not available for all the 
investigated countries and data published earlier were often revised and 
changed, frequently leading to the ambivalent structure of the said index. 

From among the 11 countries, Estonia was the unquestioned leader 
reaching first the index value of over 0.5 in 1996 and 1.0 in 1997. During 
2001-2009 Estonia recorded the highest OFDIPI values, and in 2009 the 
index went up to a record level of 3.805. Such an outstanding performance 
by Estonia was due to a surge in outward FDI even in the face of rising 
inward FDI stock. In subsequent years the OFDIPI of Estonia showed 
considerable fluctuations. 

Another leader, Hungary, recorded its highest OFDIPI values in 1997 
(together with Estonia and Croatia) and in 1999 (together with Slovakia), 
surpassing in 2003, 2005, 2006, 2011, 2012 and 2014 the threshold value of 
1, reflecting high relative effectiveness in outward FDI expansion, which in 
turn was perceived as the key factor in upgrading the country’s international 
competitiveness. Worth noting was the one-time OFDIPI of 5.287 reached 
by Hungary in 2012. 
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The case of Slovenia’s OFDIPI is particularly interesting. It recorded a 
value of over 1 only twice (in 2003 and 2005) but eight times it showed 
negative values, indicating disinvestment abroad on the part of Slovenian 
investors. Then there is the case of six countries (Bulgaria, Latvia, Lithuania, 
Poland, Romania and Slovakia), which had a common attribute of OFDIPI 
being lower than 1. In 2014 the OFDIPI of Bulgaria, Latvia, and Poland was 
positive and for the rest of the group (Lithuania, Romania and Slovakia) 
negative. It should be emphasised that Bulgaria, the least developed in the 
group of all the 11 countries, had a much higher OFDIPI of 0.519 in 2014 
than the six other more developed countries (Czechia, Latvia, Lithuania, 
Romania, Slovakia and Slovenia). This can be interpreted as evidence of the 
rising international competitiveness of Bulgarian firms. Croatia and Czechia 
differentiated themselves from the rest by recording, at least once, values of 
OFDIPI higher than 1. In the case of Croatia this occurred in 2002, 2009 and 
2014, but taking into account data from the remaining years it cannot be 
considered as a continuing trend. Also worth noting is the fact that Czechia 
had only once (in 2013) an OFDIPI higher than 1 (1.115), however next year 
its value turned negative (-0.147). 

The above observations concerning OFDIPI country values lead to the 
following key conclusions. If the observed OFDIPI trends can be interpreted 
as an indication of a country’s capability to move from one IDP stage to the 
next, the referenced data do not unequivocally confirm such trends. 
Secondly, there is a marked lack of correlation between OFDIPI values and 
the level of economic development measured by GDP p.c. Worth stressing is 
the considerable spread of this index between countries for a given year as 
well as its volatility for each country in a dynamic perspective. 

5. DISCUSSION AND CONCLUSIONS 

5.1. Summary of key findings 

The first group of conclusions relates to the issue of the permanent 
character of each of the investigated countries’ passage into IDP Stage 3 or 
being firmly lodged in that stage. The findings of the authors’ previous study 
with a similar profile and objectives, but encompassing an earlier time 
period, were subjected to detailed scrutiny and verification. In many cases 
the previous findings have been modified by the passage of time (six years) 
and the economic development of those countries in that period of time. 

The first conclusion is that currently none of the 11 CEE countries was in 
its IDP Stage 2 anymore, which indicates that they were able to liberate 
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themselves from the absence or low level of international competitiveness 
leading them to rely more on inward FDI than on their fledgling outward 
investments. Yet at the same time they were also far away from IDP Stage 4 
(the second conclusion) which, according to the original IDP model, is the 
stage where the most economically advanced countries are positioned. This 
of course is not a drawback but may be considered as a specific benchmark 
to which these 11 states should aspire to, providing motivation for their firms 
to acquire competitive advantages allowing them to continue on their foreign 
expansion trajectories and for their economic policies to stimulate and 
sustain such outward investment expansion. 

The third conclusion, perhaps the key one, is that the majority of the 
investigated countries were positioned somewhere between the crossing 
point from Stage 2 and Stage 3 of their IDPs and the beginning/first leg of 
Stage 3. This can be construed in a way as a sign of success for countries 
which have since the early 1990s undertaken the historic, challenging and 
largely unexplored project of transition to a market-led system. Through this 
project the development and competitive gap separating them from the 
highly developed economies has been reduced considerably. 

Thus, according to the analysis conducted in this study Bulgaria, 
Hungary, Slovakia, Lithuania and Estonia were found to be positioned at the 
very beginning of their IDP Stage 3. Taking into account the data presented 
in Table 1. Poland, Romania and Czechia could also be added to this group. 
Slightly more advanced on the IDP curve of Stage 3 were Latvia and 
Croatia. Slovenia, the wealthiest (as per GDP p.c.) in the group, was 
positioned as the most advanced in the IDP Stage 3. 

Moreover, taking into account the time frame of moving from IDP Stage 
2 to Stage 3, in the case of Hungary, Croatia and Czechia, this happened 
before 2013. For the majority: Bulgaria, Poland, Romania, Slovakia, Estonia, 
Latvia and Lithuania it was 2013, and only for Slovenia it turned out to be 
2014. 

Within the sub-group of countries, where the turning point from IDP 
Stage 2 to Stage 3 occurred in 2013, a trend was detected that with rising 
country GDP p.c. the turning point was generally positioned at a lower NOI 
p.c. value. In line with this trend, countries with low GDP p.c. in the group 
like Romania and Bulgaria, were able to cross the line over to Stage 3 at a 
relatively high NOI p.c. values, due not as much to the competitiveness of 
their firms investing abroad but rather to lower outward and inward FDI 
stocks. The explanation of this phenomenon might also reside in the 
idiosyncratic character of GDP p.c. and NOI p.c. movements of these 
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countries. Another important observation concerned the recurring 
reversibility of a country’s movement along its IDP trajectory. In this study 
this happened with Hungary and Croatia but was limited to a relatively short 
time period and concerned fluctuations in and out of IDP Stage 3. 

Thus, the current findings provide indirect confirmation of the success of 
the transition process to a market-led system which the 11 countries had 
been implementing throughout the past two decades and of the prominent 
role which foreign direct investment has played in this process and in the 
overall economic development of these economies. Of course, the 
contribution of FDI to the positive effects of that transition varied in the 
analyzed economies. Without doubt there were differences as to the impact 
of inward and outward FDI on the GDP of each country, and a number of 
idiosyncratic factors played a role in the development trajectories of the 
respective economies. However, it should be stressed that FDI, together with 
many other key factors, played an important role as drivers of the 
transformation process. 

5.2. Policy implications 

The policy implications presented below, although based mainly on the 
experience of Poland, are nonetheless generally applicable to all the 11 
investigated countries. Recommendations for economic policy based on the 
IDP analysis conducted in this study focus on the issue of the countries’ 
governments support and stimulation of outward FDI of their firms. 
Moreover, a careful scrutiny of received FDI theory reveals at 
microeconomic level, more or less explicitly, that outward FDI does serve as 
a means of achieving firms’ strategic objectives and enhancing their 
international competitiveness. At macroeconomic level there is no sound 
evidence that outward FDI has had a detrimental effect on home economies 
(Gorynia et al., 2015). The consequences of outward FDI for home 
economies vary in the short-run and in the long-run, as well as between 
developed and developing countries, which does not make formulating clear 
policy recommendations an easy task. 

In Poland the current policy approach has focused on stimulating 
economic growth through a plan of supporting the investment expansion of 
Polish firms abroad. An important problem in implementing the Polish 
system of support measures for outward FDI and relating to its overall 
efficiency has been its dispersion and overlapping of responsibilities. Thus, a 
challenge for Poland, like for the other post-transformation economies from 
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the region, lies in establishing a central authority institutional framework 
with a clearly defined scope of responsibility and appropriate competences 
in terms of fostering outward foreign direct investment. Such centralization 
would potentially also contribute to an improvement of awareness by the 
potential recipients of such support measures. Currently, aside from 
anecdotal evidence, little is known about the barriers of using support 
measures, as well as their productivity from the perspective of users, hence 
the call for more analytical efforts. 

Apart from questions related to the institutional arrangement, a more 
nuanced approach seems to be necessary to reflect the potential beneficial 
effects of outward FDI for the home economy. One of the important 
variables determining the access to and type of support measures should be 
the origin of capital of outward investors, whereby genuinely domestic firms 
should be fostered rather than foreign subsidiaries located in a given host 
country, whose rationale for investing may be quite different. Also (as 
observed in Poland), innovativeness-oriented investments seem to have been 
currently less in the focus of managerial attention compared to those aimed 
at only increasing foreign sales. Accordingly, specific support programs 
connected to the accomplishment of a given set of competitiveness-
enhancing objectives should also be introduced. In this context it should be 
noted that in received literature (e.g. Gorynia et al., 2015; Luo et al. 2010; 
Sarmah, 2003; Te Velde, 2007), as well as in economic policy statements 
there has been an ongoing discussion as to the dilemma of whether 
governments should actively influence the sectoral structure of inward and 
outward foreign investment. Yet this issue was not considered as key here 
and therefore was left outside the scope of this study. 

5.3. Future research suggestions 

It appears that the IDP evolution of the 11 investigated countries of CEE, 
members of the EU, was driven by the transition process to a market-led 
system initiated at the beginning of the 1990s. Its progress was facilitated by 
the policy of systemic change. Among the 11 CEE countries there were 
significant differences regarding each of these two variables, which 
unquestionably contributed to the creation of differing foreign capital 
absorption capacities as well as different premises for capital exports. Thus, 
the comparative analysis of this study could be complemented and enriched 
by a country case study approach, since even in the situation of congruence 
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of some of the investigated factors it is quite probable that they could 
conceal dissimilar economic, sociological, political and institutional 
components, generating IDP country idiosyncrasies. 

The second research avenue could focus on international comparisons of 
groups of countries, determined according to various criteria. The IDP model 
in such approach could yield much insight if in its framework, for example, 
the evolution of the new EU members from CEE was set against the 
experience of earlier entrants, such as Spain, Portugal and Greece. Another 
comparison in the IDP context could embrace the present 11 CEE countries 
and those post-communist states that did not join the EU. It is possible in this 
case that the roles of inward as well as outward FDI in both those groups 
could prove to be significantly different and contribute to a differentiated 
level of economic development. Thus, the scale and mechanisms generating 
such differences are worthy of exploration and could form a promising 
research agenda. 

The third potential research issue consists of investigating the present 11 
countries from the perspective of the geographic and industry structures of 
their inward and outward FDI. Determining and explaining the differences 
along such cross sections, as well as showing their consequences for the 
welfare of each country, could develop into an inspiring research project. 

Last but not least on the forthcoming research agenda should be the role 
of institutional factors in analyzing the progress of the CEE countries on 
their IDPs. The effects of EU accession in this context were discussed 
already in the authors’ previous study but this was conducted from a 
necessarily short-term perspective. Therefore, since more time has passed, it 
would be valuable to revisit this issue. Of primary importance remains also 
the investigation of the extent and character of the role of governments and 
their institutions in planning and implementing economic policy measures 
enhancing the competitiveness of firms and countries. 
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